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and rushed 'round the house and out the front gate, but as I took one step out 
of the gate, my next step fell on the front steps of the house a mile away, where 
our sick friend was! It startled me greatly of course. I know that I was carried 
that mile instantly, because some fifteen minutes later the rest of the men I had 
been praying with came puffing down the road. They asked me: 'How did you 
get here so fast?' '' 

David needed to get there immediately so God simply provided his 
transportation! 

In the last few years, what is perhaps the most powerful revival of New 
Testament Christianity the world has ever seen is taking place in Indonesia. 
Well-documented reports have been coming from there of miraculous events of 
the same nature and magnitude as in the Bible. Thousands have been 
miraculously fed on provisions for a few hundred, water has been turned to 
wine for the purpose of Holy Communion, groups of Christians have walked on 
water in order to cross rivers to proclaim the good news of Christ, to say 
nothing of thousands healed, and many even raised from the dead. One might 
dismiss these reports as fanciful, except they are confirmed by reliable 
witnesses, and often by Christians who did not previously believe that such 
New Testament miracles could or would take place today. Perhaps the 
strongest indirect evidence of the truth of these signs, is that over two and one-
half million Moslems have accepted Christ, as well as thousands of 
Communists. The Moslem press recently admitted to the conversion of two 
million Mohammedans to the Christian faith! One of the big reasons 
undoubtedly is that they are seeing the power of God manifested, not only in 
the miracle of changed lives, but in the literal miracles of the Bible. Why should 
such amazing events be taking place? It is because people in Indonesia have 
never been told that certain parts of the Bible are "not for today"; therefore they 
are putting it into practice in simple faith! It works! God is alive! 

God takes real chances when He shares His supernatural works with His 
people. He would no doubt work more miracles among His people but knows 
that unless we are spiritually prepared it may be harmful to us. We heard the 
true story of an evangelist who had been mightily used of God, until one 
evening the power and glory of God lifted this person several feet off the 
ground, in full view of the congregation! The experience was so impressive, 
that from that night on, that particular servant of God could talk only of how 
some day Christians would be carried from place to place in the Spirit all over 
the world to proclaim the Gospel! It became that evangelist's one theme, to the 
serious hindrance of preaching the Gospel, and a good ministry was rendered 
almost useless. 

It is worthwhile to stop and analyze this particular example. What was the 
purpose of this miracle? We might say at once: "Oh, it was to prove to the 
onlookers that what the evangelist was saying was true!" No, that won't quite 
do; because, you see, Satan can also lift people off the ground in the 
phenomenon called "levitation". Among those who dabble in the occult today, 
some are experimenting with this very thing, trying to learn how to
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